
Guide Dogs of America
Open House Silent Auction - 2019

Special Items

100 GDA Pendant

Once again Warren Marriott, Master Goldsmith (and 
GDA Puppy Raiser), has handcrafted this 
impeccable, one of a kind 14 karat white gold & 
natural Blue Lapis pendant.
The Guide Dogs of America insignia was recreated 
to perfection in this beautifully inspired piece. This is 
the culmination of spirit and craftsmanship, from the 
spark of inspiration to the beautiful final product you 
see here.
This extraordinary pendant hangs on a 14 karat 
white gold (18") link chain. Diameter of the pendant 
is the exact diameter, and double the thickness of a 
quarter. All gold is solid 14K. Weight is 13.6 grams, 
including chain and Lapis.
Retail Value: $1,850.00

101 Day with the Trainers for Two

This is an amazing opportunity to get to the core of 
what GDA does best, train guide dogs. Join the 
trainers for a full day and participate in all facets of 
what they do and how they work with the dogs. 
Arriving early to start the day by participating in the 
morning kennel duties, loading dogs into their 
kennels in the van and heading into the city where 
you will observe and participate in the trainers daily 
activities. We will treat you to lunch and then back to 
work! You will arrive back at the school around 2:30 
or 3:00 pm for a debriefing conference.
Important Notes: For two people, Monday through 
Friday on a date mutually agreed upon with the 
training department. Winners must be at least 18 
years of age and able to walk 4 to 5 miles (broken 
up) in one day near our campus. This is an active 
day so please wear sturdy shoes.

102 Join GDA at Bally's in Las Vegas - 
Four Day Extravaganza!

Join us for the 39th Annual Guide Dogs of America 
Charity Banquet and Golf Tournament. The trip 
includes four days of festivities from November 
21-24, 2019, including three night stay (Nov 21-23) 
for two at Bally's Las Vegas. Also included in the 
package are party bus transportation from the GDA 
campus, two rounds of golf in our tournament at the 
Angel Park Golf Club on Friday, and tickets for two 
to the W.W. Winpisinger Charity Banquet on 
Saturday night.
Terms and Conditions: Award attendees must be 
confirmed with GDA by August 1, 2019.

Sports

200 4 Tickets for the LA Kings

If you're a Kings fan, you won't want to miss out on 
this opportunity...
Rogie Vachon is donating 4 tickets for lower bowl 
seats at one 2019 Kings game (these are his 
season tickets). Yes, that Rogie Vachon – the three-
time Stanley Cup champion and Hall of Fame goalie. 
Once Rogie receives his tickets for the upcoming 
season, he'll offer you a choice of three possible 
games to choose from. We can only imagine how 
great these seats are... and what a great time you'll 
have watching the game from them.

202 2 Dodgers tickets vs the 
Diamondbacks on Tuesday, July 2 at 

7:10pm

Think Blue!
Two tickets to see the Dodgers vs the 
Diamondbacks at Dodger Stadium. The tickets are 
located in Section 102LG, Row M, Seats 1 and 2. 
Admission to the Stadium Club and parking in Lot K 
are also included.
The game is on Tuesday, July 2 at 7:10pm.

203 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Padres on 
Tuesday, July 4 at 6:10pm

Do You Bleed Dodger Blue?
Enjoy the 4th with two tickets to see the Dodgers vs 
the Padres at Dodger Stadium. These seats are 
located on the Field Level in Section 10FD, Row M, 
Seats 1 and 2 and include access to the Stadium 
Club. Preferred parking is also included.
And, since it's the 4th of July, there will be a special 
Fireworks show after the game in addition to 
patriotic celebrations prior to the game. A great day 
for a ballgame to celebrate America's birthday!
The game is on Tuesday, July 4, 2019 starting at 
6:10pm.

204 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Padres on 
Sunday, July 7 at 1:10pm

Root, root, root for the Dodgers!
Enjoy a fun summer afternoon with two tickets to 
see the Dodgers vs the Padres at Dodger Stadium. 
These seats are located on the Field Level in 
Section 10FD, Row M, Seats 1 and 2 and include 
access to the Stadium Club. Preferred parking is 
also included.
Plus, this game is still part of the July 4th weekend 
festivities so after the game all kids (and their 
parent) get to run the bases!
The game is on Sunday, July 7, 2019 starting at 
1:10pm.
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205 4 Dodgers tickets vs the Marlins on 
Friday, July 19 at 7:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Come spend an evening enjoying America's pastime 
at Dodger Stadium. Plus, enjoy the Friday home 
game fireworks show! These seats are located on 
the Loge Level in Section 17FD, Row C, Seats 1 - 4 
and include admission to the Stadium Club. 
Preferred parking is also included.
The game is on Friday, July 19, 2019 starting at 7:10 
p.m.

206 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Marlins on 
Sunday, July 21 at 1:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Come spend an afternoon enjoying America's 
pastime as the Dodgers take on the Marlins at 
Dodger Stadium! The tickets are located in Section 
118LG, Row R, Seats 1 and 2. Parking is also 
included.
The game is on Sunday, July 21, 2019 starting at 
1:10 p.m.

207 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Padres on 
Friday, August 2 at 7:10pm

LA Bleeds Blue!
Two tickets to see the Dodgers vs the Padres at 
Dodger Stadium. The tickets are located in Section 
102LG, Row M, Seats 1 and 2. Admission to the 
Stadium Club and parking in Lot K are also included.
Plus, stay after the game and enjoy themed 
fireworks shows after the game. Fans are invited to 
take a seat on the field to watch the show!
The game is on Friday, August 2 at 7:10pm.

208 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Padres on 
Sunday, August 4 at 1:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Come spend an afternoon enjoying America's 
pastime as the Dodgers take on the Padresat 
Dodger Stadium! The tickets are located in Section 
118LG, Row R, Seats 1 and 2. Parking is also 
included.
The game is on Sunday, August 4, 2019 starting at 
1:10 p.m.

209 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Cardinals on 
Monday, August 5 at 7:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Enjoy a fun summer afternoon with two tickets to 
see the Dodgers vs the Cardinals at Dodger 
Stadium. These seats are located on the Field Level 
in Section 10FD, Row M, Seats 1 and 2 and include 
access to the Stadium Club. Preferred parking is 
also included.
The game is on Monday, August 5, 2019 starting at 
7:10pm.

210 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Blue Jays on 
Tuesday, August 20 at 7:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Two tickets to see the Dodgers vs the Blue Jays at 
Dodger Stadium. The tickets are located in Section 
102LG, Row M, Seats 1 and 2. Admission to the 
Stadium Club and parking in Lot K are also included.
The game is on Tuesday, August 20 at 7:10pm.

211 2 Dodgers tickets vs the Rockies on 
Saturday, September 21 at 6:10pm

Go Dodger Blue!
Two tickets to see the Dodgers vs the Rockies at 
Dodger Stadium. The tickets are located in Section 
102LG, Row M, Seats 1 and 2. Admission to the 
Stadium Club and parking in Lot K are also included.
The game is on Saturday, September 21 at 6:10pm.

Guys & Gals

305 23andMe DNA Test - Health + Ancestry 
Personal Genetic Service

23andMe DNA Test - Health + Ancestry Personal 
Genetic Service - includes reports on Health, 
Wellness, Ancestry & More
Get a summary of your Ancestry Composition and 
see detailed percentages from regions around the 
world - now with 1,000+ Ancestry Regions. Trace 
Your Ancestry Timeline and discover when different 
ancestries were introduced into your DNA.

306 Wedded Bliss

Two champagne flutes; Pinot Grigio Champagne; 
Wedding picture frame; Small crystal bowl; Wooden 
sign; Ring holder

307 Chivas to You

Two passes to the Ronald Reagan Presidential 
Library & Museum; Chivas Regal 12 year Scotch 
Whiskey; Five Guide Dogs of America etched 
highball glasses
Terms and Conditions: Expire March 31, 2020 (not 
to be extended). Does not include special exhibit 
fee. Closed Thanksgiving day, Christmas day, and 
New Year's day.

308 Me and My Car

Sentry Safe Fire Safe Security Box; $25 Uber gift 
card; Assortment of 360 auto detailing products; 
Smart phone holder for your car

309 Lady in Black

Black and silver Danny K. purse; Black and silver 
Danny K. phone holder; Silver picture frame; Black 
and silver watch; Black with silver accent earrings; 
Mikasa candle holder; Glass vase; Black, grey, and 
silver scarf; Small floating candle

310 Lady's Day Out

Isabella Fiore needlepoint Labrador dog satchel; 
Blue throw; Two necklaces (10" and 12"); Bottle of 
Nectar of the Dogs wine
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311 Lover's Lane

Bottle of Dubost 2012 Reserve Sarah; Two crystal 
wine glasses; Mirrored picture frame; Mikasa glass 
votive holder; Wild at Heart DVD; Silver heart 
bracelet; Crystal wine stopper; Two heart shaped 
boxes; Wine infused chocolates; "Love" candle; 
Heart shaped plush dog toy

312 Digitize It

Ion USB Turntable/Vinyl Archiver

313 Here Comes the Bride

Choose a seat wedding sign; Two crystal 
champagne glasses; Crystal Champagne bucket; 

Bottle of The Final Rose 2016 Rosé; 4"x12" photo 
frame; Congratulations wedding card

314 Whisky Business

Bottle of Stronachie 10 Year Old Scotch Whisky; 
Glass whisky decanter; Two GDA highball glasses; 
Whiskey rocks; Dog policeman figure; Whiskey 
book; Pipe shaped dog toy

315 Black & Gold

Large purse; 5"x7" photo frame; $20 Starbucks gift 
card; Marble bud vase; Kira Kira gold and black 
necklace and matching earings; Hand crocheted 
scarf; Yankee candle; Crystal swan; Two rust 
colored cloth napkins

316 For Him

Tourmaster Advanced Textile jacket (certificate 
expires November 30, 2019); Iron Gym workout 
equipment;$50 Nike gift card; Non-stick grill mat

317 Beauty In Black

Brighton necklace (16"-18") and earrings (1 1/2" 
dangle); "The Sac" purse; Assorted black and white 
stationary; Leeds pen; 4"x6" picture frame

318 Relax My Back

Sharper Image Magnetic Therapy Roll Massager; D-
section Lumbar Roll; Neck Relief adjustable neck 
support; "Not A Water Bottle" heating pad; $25 Nike 
gift card

325 Guy Stuff

Barbar Professional Charging Electric Trimmer 
($135 value); Tumi credit card leather case; Sound 
Bot; Vices trivia game set; Crazy Geezer's Putty; 
Rogie Vachon signed puck; LA Kings-themed fleece 
throw

326 For the Wine Lover

You and a guest will join a comprehensive tour of 
Callaway Vineyard & Winery's modern winemaking 
facility in Temecula. Explore every aspect of the 
winemaking process, from growing the grapes to 
bottling the wine. Following your tour, you will taste a 
selection of Callaway's premium wines.
Bottle of Justin Isosceles 2016 ($75 value); Bottle of 
Dubost 2013 Grenache ($40 value); Two wine 
glasses
Terms and Conditions: Daily tours of the 
winemaking facilities are scheduled at 11am and 
1pm. Wine tasting is offered daily from 10:30 am 
through 6pm. Certificate expires December 31, 
2020.

327 My Love for Brighton

Gold and silver necklace (16 1/2" drop, adjustable); 
Gold bangle; "Love the Earth" tote; 5"x7" photo 
frame

328 Mom

$50 Nordstrom gift card; Three-tier gold/black 
necklace; Ceramic bud vase; Patchouli scented 
candle; Mom book; Super Mom wooden sign; 
Change purse

329 Her Crate & Barrel

$50 Crate and Barrel gift card; Modern glass/metal 
vase; Handmade pottery bowl; Medium sized 
crocheted shrug; Great Gifts in Under 30 Minutes
notebook catalog; Butterfly frame

330 Her Backpack

$25 Sephora gift card; Colorful backpack; Bottle of 
wine; Tokyo Bay pink watch; Two GDA wine goblets

332 Ladie's Delight

Instant Infusion Pitcher; Orange Muscat Champagne 
Vinegar; Pink wallet; Pottery vase; Frankincense 
candle; Embroidered pot holder and green dish 
towel; Turquoise bead necklace; Turquoise earrings; 
Bicycle design plate

333 For Her

Barbar Professional Blow Dryer ($65 value); Barbar 
Professional Flat Iron ($135 value); Barbar Ionic 
Brush ($27 value); Shoulder tote bag

334 Toast the Bride & Groom

Marquis Waterford bowl; Two bottles of champagne; 
Two hand made antique champagne bottle décor; 
Two gold embellished champagnd glasses; Six 
handmade antique coasters; Small gold picture 
frame

335 Jasper Necklace

16" faceted Jasper necklace ($75 value); ceramic 
bowl; 5"x7" picture frame; Small decorative boot; 
Handmade card

336 Beautiful & Sweet

$25 See's Candy gift card; Royal Albert vintage floral 
plate
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Odds & Ends

400 Soda Stream

Soda Stream Fizzi Machine includes one cartridge 
and three water bottles; Four bottles of diet cola 
flavoring

401 Let's Cook

Eight piece Sunbeam Cookware Set; Nutri Slicer; 
Two dish towels; Coffee Mug; Dark Canyon coffee

402 Bake It

$25 in Target gift cards; Heart Tasty Fill Cake Pan 
Set; Heart shape cake pan; Cake serving plate and 
server; Country Goodness Cookbook; Fun-cup 
baking tins; Two Lindt chocolate bars

403 Patriotic Picnic

Insulated picnic basket; Kong flyer; Ball launcher 
plus three extra balls; Two water cozies; Portable 
water bowl; Two kitchen towels; Patriotic photo 
props; Patriotic bandana; Nylabones; Assorted dog 
toys

404 Slo Cookin'

Toastmaster 5 Quart Slow Cooker; $50 gift card 
good at TJ Maxx, Marshall's, Home Goods, and 
Sierra Trading Post; Grocery cart bags

405 Coffee Time

Kuerig Hot K55 Classic Series coffee maker with 48 
oz reservoir; K-cup pod carousel; $25 Starbucks gift 
card

406 Rise & Shine

$100 in Starbucks Gift Cards; Hamilton Beach 
Breakfast Sandwich Maker; Elite Cuisine Belgian 
Waffle Maker; Teapot and cozy; Coffee mug; 
Medium size fleece throw

407 Eleca Acoustic Guitar

"Eleca" Acoustic Guitar (Model: DAG-3-BK); "Euro" 
padded travel bag; "Franklin Strap" suede guitar 
strap; Guitar stand
All items gently used

408 Google Home Hub

Help at a glance - Google Home Hub helps you 
make the most of moments at home. Command 
your day - With Voice Match, get your calendar, 
commute, reminders, and more right on the home 
screen. You can even watch the news, make a 
shopping list, and place calls to friends, family, and 
local businesses. Simplify your smart home -
Voice control compatible lights, cameras, TVs, and 
more from a single dashboard. 7-inch touch 
screen - View more information and content at a 
glance, clear and crisp. Answers for any moment -
Ask questions and get visual, immersive answers 
from Google on weather, recipes, local business 
information, and more. And watch helpful videos 
from YouTube. Play your favorite songs - Use 
your voice to play your favorite songs, albums, 
artists, and music videos from YouTube Music. You 
can also listen to Spotify and Pandora.

409 Trick Or Treat

Bat embossed decorative bowl; 2-tier serving tray 
with bat top design; Two custom glass pumpkins; 
Lead crystal pumpkin candy dish with lid; Set of 
Halloween photo props; Ten assorted halloween 
themed dog toys 

410 Blues in the Kitchen

Four piece non-stick cookware plus three lids and 
mandoline slicer; Picnic blanket; Carve and serve 
knife set; $10 El Pollo Loco gift card

411 Slicing & Baking

Purex Bake and Store 8 piece set; Three piece 
glass canister set; vegetable slicer; $25 Starbucks 
gift card; Decorative tote; Kitchen towel; Grapefruit 
Mandarin soap bar

412 Hippie Dippy

VW Bus decorative wall hanging; Chiropractic 
appintment with Dr. Heidi Fennell in Glendale, CA; 
26" turquoise necklace, bracelet, and earrings; 
Peace sign change purse; Peace sign sholder strap 
beaded purse; Willow Creek Pancake Mix and 
Maple Syrup; Candle

413 Let There Be Light

Two solar powered rope lights; Four LED photo clip 
string lights; Rotating police party light

414 In-N-Out Burger

In-N-Out gift cards valued at up to $64; In-N-Out t-
shirt (Men's Large); In-N-Out 1000 piece jigsaw 
puzzle; In-N-Out Drink cup; In-N-Out burger key 
chain; In-N-Out baseball cap; In-N-Out stickers, note 
pad, and pencil
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415 Let's Take A Ride

$25 Uber gift card; Puppy Raiser license plate 
frame; Auto shade; Dog-theme travel mug; Large 
plush stuffed animal; Doggles UV protected dog 
glasses; Travel bowl; Retractable leash; Four pocket 
leash saddle; Standard size pillow case; Three plush 
dog toys

416 Picnic with My Pup

$25 Jerry's Restaurant and Deli gift card; Wine 
bottle cooler tote; Collapsible travel dog bowl; Kong; 
Nylabone chew; Pet bandana; Waste bag holder 
and refills; Large bottle of Bubble Fun; Can/water 
bottle cozy; Three assorted dog toys

417 It's 5 O'Clock Somewhere

$25 Chili's gift card; Jose Cuervo Tequila; Margarita 
mix; Two margarita glasses; Jalapeno sauce; 
Margarita salt; Two colorful napkins; Mango candle; 
Fun stuffed dog toy; Four decorative clips

418 Elegant

Crystal decorative bowl; Four linen napkins

419 Amazon Shopping Spree

$50 Amazon gift card; Miniature shopping cart; Five 
assorted dog toys

420 Drink Up

Beautiful three gallon glass/cast aluminum cold 
beverage dispenser

421 Family Time

$50 gift card pack for Applebee's ($25) and AMC 
($25);Corn Dog maker; Rockin Neon Nites bowling 
for two at Valencia Lanes (expire December 2019); 
Large picture frame; Two fun pillowcases

422 Premium Monopoly

Tabletop Luxury Monopoly Set for 2-6 players ($190 
value); Monopoly-themed fleece throw

423 Amazon Echo

Amazon Echo is a hands-free speaker you control 
with your voice. Echo connects to the Alexa Voice 
Service to play music, ask questions, make calls, 
send and receive messages, provide information, 
new, sports scores, weather, and more - instantly. 
All you have to do is ask.

424 Fun Crystal

Set of four each: red wine goblets, white wine 
goblets, and Champagne goblets; Crystal appetizer 
dish; Bottle of Pine Ridge Chenin Blanc; Plus, a 
surprise box of extra goblets

425 Cheesecake & Mai Tais

$50 Cheesecake Factory gift card; Four plastic drink 
cups; Plastic serving tray; Four Tommy Bahama 
melamine appetizer plates; Five gallon grow bag; 
One gallon grow bag; Dog Lover garden flag; Love 
in a Nutshell (large print edition)

426 Love to Cook

Eight piece stainless steel Sunbeam cookware set; 
Copper crisper tray; Set of four Trolley shopping 
bags; Four napkins

427 Low & Slow

3.5 liter slow cooker; Decorative mixing bowl; Just A 
Matter of Thyme cookbook; Five piece mini utensil 
set; $15 Daily Grille gift card

428 Warmth

Set of five LED wax candles plus 20 AA batteries 
($64 value); "I'm Not Bossy, I Just Have Better 
Ideas" pillow; Ceramic vase

429 Garden Whimsey

Flower pot; Kneeling pad; Magic Screen Door; 
Scissors for cutting herbs; Spider Catcher; Poop 
carrying bag; Notepad; Sign of Wisdom; Wooden 
bones on string; Various dog toys

430 Stars & Stripes

Patriotic Rolling Cooler; Ordinary Heroes tribute 
book; Four white acrylic plates; Four blue acrylic 
plates; Four acrylic glasses; Four placemats; Four 
cloth napkins; Kitchen towel; Rope toy; Handmade 
card

431 Starbucks!

$80 in Starbucks gift cards

432 Best Buy

$50 Best Buy gift card

433 Target

$100 Target gift card

434 For the Car

7 liter Thermo-Fridge and Warmer with adapter for 
the car; VIZR Heads Up display; Tourmaster 
Advanced Textile jacket (certificate expires 
November 30, 2019); BYO wine tote

435 50" 4K TV

The R7 4K UHD Smart Hisense Roku TV is perfect 
for presenting your favorite entertainment in a whole 
new way. Featuring 4K Ultra High Definition 
resolution, the R7 packs incredible detail into an 
HDR-enhanced display that boosts contrast and 
color. The Roku OS serves up a massive library of 
premium content at the touch of a button, and with 
Motion Rate processing tech, you can enjoy the 
fastest action without lag or judder. Easily connect 
the R7 to the internet with Wi-Fi Dual Band Wireless 
and enjoy everything the web has to offer.
Note: HDR viewing experience will vary by model, 
content availability and internet connection.

437 Framed Prints of Wild Ducks and 
Geese

Wouldn't these two prints look great in your man 
cave? One depicts ducks and the other depicts 
geese. 
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438 Summer Fun

$25 See's Candy gift card; Navy felt tote; Acrylic 
serving platter; Indoor/outdoor 70" round tablecloth; 
Four insulated wine tumblers; Bottle of Chardonnay; 
Anthropologie dish towel; Wine stopper

439 Halloween Fun

Halloween-themed quilt. 42" x 50"

440 Home Is Where The Dog Is

Hanging quilt. 23 1/2" x 46"

441 Animal Party

Doggie quilt. 50" x 62"

442 I Love Dogs

Small quilted throw. 29" x 29"

443 Comfy

Flannel quilt. 50" x 64"

444 Squares

Quilt. 57" x 69"

445 Green Garden

Quilt. 65" x 81"

446 Jungle

Quilt. 70" x 78"

447 Jaymee's Flower Garden

Hand-quilted. 76" x 93"

448 Dulcimer Artistry

Handcrafted Dulcimer by Kentucky artist Warren A. 
May

449 There's A Dog On My Quilt

How'd a dog get on that quilt? 43" x 51"

450 Doll House

Magnificent vintage doll house with all the 
furnishings. Includes table to stand on.

451 Holiday Barbies

1995 Special Edition Happy Holidays Barbie ($30 
value); 2001 Special Edition Holiday Celebration 
Barbie ($50 value)

452 A Toast

$25 Home Depot gift card; Bottle of Pinot Noir; 
Rabbit cork screw and aerator set; Two wine 
glasses; BYO bottle bag

Children

500 Beach Fun

$15 Target gift card; Dog-themed boogie board; 
Beach towel and bag; Two cups; Two blow-up 
beach toys; Pail of beach toys; Assorted dog toys 

501 Bedtime Sweets

Puppy Flashlight Friends; Three Dr. Seuss including 
Hop On Pop, Green Eggs and Ham, and Hand, 
Hand, Fingers, Thumb; Heart felt applique; 48"x50" 
fleece throw; One standard size pillowcase; One soft 
dog toy

502 Spot On Fun

Cinematic light-up box; Two dalmation stuffed toys; 
Signed McHorn book; Rainbow art kit; "Love" frame; 
Pillowcase; Uno card game; Mickey Mouse stamps

503 Scooby-Do!

Twelve assorted Scooby-Do toys and collectables; 
One Scooby-Do onesie (size 3 months); One 
Scooby-Do onesie and long pant set (size 3-6 
months); One Scooby-Do top and shorts set (size 18 
months); Two pair of Scooby-Do socks (size 10-13)

504 Ninjago!

"The Ninjago Movie" 521 piece Lego set; One 
Ninjago pajamas long sleeve/long pant set (size 8); 
One Ninjago pajamas short sleeve/short pant set 
(size 10-12) 

505 Finding Dory

5 foot indoor/outdoor expandable play tunnel; 7 pack 
of wooden Finding Dory puzzles; Ravensburger 
34"x49" Finding Dory puzzle; $25 Burger King gift 
card 

506 Superman!

Two vintage DC Comic series 11"x14" poster prints; 
8"x10" Superman canvas print; Embroidered 
Superman cap; Superman pocket watch and chain; 
Stainless steel Superman dog tag and chain; 
Superman figpin collectable; Superman embossed 
pullover hoodie (youth size XL); Superman t-shirt 
(youth size M); Man of Steel ceramic Tiki stein; 
"You're my Hero" Superman trophy; Superman dog 
collar (size L)

507 Unicorns & Puppies

Unicorn Pillow Pet; Cinematic light-up box; Unicorn 
photo-play mask; Emotidog stickers; Girls purse with 
fringe; Girls hair pins; Unicorn-themed fleece throw; 
Heart shaped felt patch; Six assorted dog toys

508 KACHOW!!

$25 in Target gift cards; Cars diecast fun 4-pack; 
Two Disney diecast cars; Disney Cars matching 
game; Two Disney Cars puzzles; Disney Cars beach 
bucket; Two decks of Disney Cars playing cards; 
Disney Cars PEZ dispenser

509 Red Robin Yum & Disney Fun

$25 Red Robin gift card; Twelve assorted Disney 
toys

510 The Lego Movie 2 Lego Set

The Lego Movie 2 1187 piece Lego kit ($120 value)
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511 Sweet Mayhem!

The Lego Movie 2 1024 piece Lego kit ($80 value); 
The Lego Movie 2 502 piece Lego kit ($70 value)

512 Emmet's Rescue!

The Lego Movie 2 Emmet's Dream House/Rescue 
Rocket! 2-in-1 706 piece Lego set ($70 value)

513 Batman & Friends DC Comic Figurines

Nine assorted DC Comic action figures; Three DC 
Comic Justice League magnets

514 Batman Palooza

Adult batman watch; Youth Batman watch; Three 
Batman theme ball caps; Batman knit cap; Two t-
shirts (Adult Med and Youth Lrg); Robin theme 
lounger pants (Adult M); Twelve Batman colletables 
and toys; Ceramic Batman Tiki cup/mug; Two 
collapsable Batman theme staorage boxes; Batman 
Thermos; Two Batman theme dog toys; Two dog 
collars and 6 ft leash

515 Girl Power!

Blend Cota art print with certificate of authenticity 
($30 value); Batgirl purple sequin backpack and 
beanie set; Supergirl t-shirt (Girls youth 7/8); Justice 
League Saving the World t-shirt (girls Youth 7/8)
Batgirl baseball cap; Batgirl dog collar; Heroines of 
DC Comics set of four wooden figures; Three 
assorted dog toys; Dog size blanket throw

516 Plushies Galore

Twenty assorted stuffed animals; Pink fleece; Sadie 
the Kitchen Dog book

517 Let It Snow

Polar Bear book; Blue stuffed bear; Frozen CD; Girls 
purse; Small Frozen box; Frozen pillowcase

518 Picnic Time

$25 Jerry's Restaurant and Deli gift card; Easy Carry 
Picnic Blanket; 28 piece picnic play set; "Feed the 
Dog" children's game; Kong ball; Collaps-A-Bowl; 
Four assorted dog toys

519 Let's Garden

Topsy Turvy garden; Kid's Step Stone Kit; Small 
garden container; Cow bank; Two gardening tools; 
Small stuffed lab toy

520 Zoo Time

Zootopia bowling; Zootopia game; Talking lion; 
Stuffed penguin; Stuffed seal; The Penguins of 
Madagascar Operation: Antarctica movie

521 Quiet Time Fun

Stuffed dog; Sadie the Kitchen Dog and Caps 4 Sale
books; Write with Me activities; Slinky; Art Rainbow; 
Dinosaur book; Dinosaur Train Dino Mighty Music
DVD; Disney coloring book and pencils

522 Justice League Loot

$25 Baskin Robbins gift card; Justice League 
Adventure kit; Three action figures; Vehicle

523 Justice League Collection

Justice League goodies including: Lunch pail; Four 
drinking glasses; Dog leash; Dog Collar; T-shirt 
(boys size 8); Ball cap; Four coasters

524 Kids In The Kitchen

$25 Burger King gift card; Dog theme kids apron; 
Kids in the Kitchen book; Ice Cream Magic Maker; 
Two Nylabones; Three food-theme dog toys; Plush 
dog toy; Pillowcase

Dogs & Cats

601 "Good Dog" Training with Jessica 
Keleshian

Six week dog training course (or 1 hour private 
session) with Jessica Keleshian of "Good Dog" 
Trainer. Jessica began her dog training career 
working for GDA. She became a Licensed Guide 
Dog Instructor in 2001, certified by the California 
State Board of Guide Dogs for the Blind. Continuing 
to work with the guide dog puppies, she established 
"Good Dog" Trainer in 2003 to work with family and 
pet dogs. This certificate entitles you to one of 
Jessica's six-week training classes or to one private 
in-home training session.
Terms and Conditions: Certificate expires June 1, 
2020. Group classes are taught in Granada Hills. 
Private training session to take place within the San 
Fernando Valley, Simi Valley, Santa Clarita Valley or 
Pasadena areas.

604 Pawprints On Your ♥
Reclining Lab puppy ceramic bowl; "Everything I 
Need to Know…" journal; "Dogs Leave Pawprints on 
Your Heart" plaque; Two kong toys; Seven assorted 
dog toys; One Nylabone; Dog themed fleece throw

605 Patriotic Pup

Patriotic lab pillow; Stainless steel bowl; Two flour 
sack kitchen towels; Three pack of Nylabones; Two 
Kong toys; One large Nylabone; Large rope toy; Blue 
collar (size L); 45"x54" patriotic-themed fleece throw

606 Beautiful Goldens

Hamilton Collector's Limited Edition "Hiding the 
Evidence" plate; Golden Revriever statue; Leather 
collar (size L) Leather leash; Dog-themed pillow; 
Dog size fleece throw; Four Nylabones; Kong 
Stuffed toy

607 Golden Delight

Hand painted Golden Retriever leash holder (3 
prongs); Leash and collar (size L) Four Nylabones; 
Two Kong Toys; Assorted dog toys; Dog size fleece 
throw 30"x40"

608 Love & A Dog

$25 gift card for Petsmart; "All You Need Is ♥"
plaque; Two dish towels; Treat holder; dog bowl; 
Three rope toys; Three Stuffed toys; Three 
Nylabone toys; Other assorted dog toys; Dog-
themed key chain
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609 Happy Tails

$50 Target gift card; Furminator; Slow feed bowl; 
Happy Tails sport pack; Two Kong toys (Large) Tuff 
Balls toy; Red leash (4 ft) and collar (size L); Eight 
assorted dog toys; Fleece throw

610 Hunting Dog

Pillow depicting labs by the fire; Three Nylabones; 
One Kong toy; Two rope toys; Three stuffed toys; 
Antler chew; 50"x60" fleece throw

611 Big Dog Lounger

Frisco Ortho Plush bolster bed XL; Folding dog toy 
box; Metal wine carrier; Two Nylabones; Assorted 
dog toys

612 Orange You Happy!

$25 iTunes card; One Fun Feeder slow bowl; One 
Kong Wubba Wet; One Woofer floor tug ring; Three 
assorted toys

613 Small Dog Style

24"x19" dog bed; Three small dog Kong toys; One 
small dog "Mammoth" tire biter; Two small dog 
Nylabone toys; Three assorted small dog toys; One 
small dog bone bling shirt

614 The Dog's Rules

"The Dog's Rules" wall décor (22" x28"); Bottle of 
Nectar of the Dogs Chardonnay; Wine bottle opener; 
Two Orvieto Classico Chardonnay glasses made in 
Italy; Wine stopper; Metal bucket; Two decorative 
napkins

615 Star Spangled Pup

Freestanding wooden patriotic dog; Two kitchen 
towels Six patriotic cloth mapkins; Treat jar; Kong; 
Nylabone; Dog brush; Assorted dog toys; Large 
fleece throw

616 Pretty In Pink (& Purple)

$25 Petsmart gift card; Large glass treat jar; 
"Friendly Welcome" wooden sign; Stainless steel 
bowl; Rubber grooming brush; Yard pinwheel; 
Nylabone; Rope toy; Assortment of latex and plush 
toys; Lots of balls; Large fleece toy

617 Color Me Black

$25 Starbucks gift card; "Fetch" treat jar; Rope 
leash; Large collar; Coffee mug and coaster; The 
Black Dogs Project book; Notepad; Poop bags; 
Metal lab statue; Nylabone; Plush toys; Small fleece 
throw

618 Purrfect Pet

Kitty cat wind chime; Four Goebel Rosina 
Wachtmeister cat mugs; Trixie cat game; Photo 
frame; Stationary; Niki Anderson book; Standard 
size pillowcase; Small puzzle

619 Christmas Dog

Ceramic cookie jar; Hat and antlers gift set; 
Standard size pillowcase; Pawprint ornament kit; I.D. 
tag lite; Rope toy with ball; Ball; Assorted plush toys

620 Ducks N' Friends at the Cheesecake 
Factory

$25 Cheesecake Factory gift card; 60"x48" fleece 
throw; Fourteen assorted dog toys

621 Kongs N' Things

Kong 36" crate mat; 3 qt stainless steel pet bowl; 
Large Kong classic toy; Medium Kong ball; Two 
Nylabone chews; Lambchop dog toy; Bag of dog 
treats; Boots & Barkley fetch toy; Rope toy; Stuffed 
toy; Fleece throw

622 Trick Or Doggie Treat

Orange tote bag; Black bucket; Reflective dog leash; 
Dog Halloween costume (Medium); Orange ball; 
Orange rope toy; Dog picture tag; "Beware of 
Owner" sign; Nylabone; Assorted toys; Six paw print 
coasters

623 Martha's Pet Cot

Indoor/outdoor pet cot for pets up to 50 lbs; "I Love 
My Dog" canvas basket; Stainless steel bowl; Two 
Nylabone chews; Kong Wubba toy; Six assorted 
toys

624 My Colorful Pup

$25 Starbucks gift card; Two stainless steel bowls; 
Kong; Nylabone; Two balls; Ring chew toy; rope toy; 
Eight plush toys; Colorful large fleece throw

625 My Wittle Weiner Dog

$20 in Target gift cards; Red ceramic dachshund; 
Dachshund leash holder; Reflective leash; 
Dachshund-shaped ceramic measuring spoons; 
Sadie the Kitchen Dog bookNote pads; Two soft 
toys; Two plastic toys; bowl; Rope frisbee; Large 
dachshund-themed fleece throw

626 Just the Right Size

Dog bed; Joan Palmer Dogs book; Double diner 
ceramic bowls; Dog bone towel; Leash and collar; 
note pad; four dog bones; ball; Nylabone; dog hair 
pick-up mitt; Five plush toys

627 Keepin' It Cool

Chillz Cooling Pad (Large); Frosty bowl; GDA water 
bottle; Two cool cozies; Ice Cream Magic Maker; 
Hemp dog treats; Kong ball; Spiky ring toy; Three 
soft toys; Two rubber dog toys; Two ice cold packs

628 Big Dog Bonanza

35"x44" plush and suede fabric, cool gel top sofa pet 
bed; XXL Jolly Ball; Two Big Dog Nylabones; Large 
red dog collar (fits up to 24"); Two Kong toys; Eight 
assorted dog toys; Pet bandana; Fleece throw

629 Welcome Home

"Welcome" metal dog sign; Paw print anti-slip mat; 
Stainless steel bowl; Black leash and collar; Kong 
toy; rope toy; Two Nylabones; Five soft toys; Dog 
stationary
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630 My Eyes Adore You

Original water color by puppy raiser Helen Lau titled 
"My Eyes Adore You"; Two Kong toys; Two rope 
toys; Two tennis balls; Two additional dog toys

631 Chocolate Labbies

"Trusted Companions" and "Afternoon Watch" 
Franklin Mint heirloom plates; Nerf Flyer; Fox plush 
toy "Woof Box"; Wooden Lab puzzle; Fleece throw

632 30" Exercise Pen

Eight panel exercise pen with door (30" high); Seven 
assorted toys

633 36" Exercise Pen

Eight panel exercise pen with door (36" high); 
Stainless steel bowl; Eight assorted toys

634 Colorful Pup

Original water color by puppy raiser Helen Lau;Two 
Nylabones; Two plastic toys; Two balls; Seven plush 
toys; Large fleece throw

635 24" Exercise Pen

Eight panel exercise pen with door (24" high); Kong 
Belly Flop toy; Stainless steel bowl; Nine assorted 
toys

636 Elevated Feeder

Raised feeder with two stainless steel bowls; eight 
assorted Kong toys

637 Doggy Pal Ball Launcher

Doggy Pal Tennis Ball Launcher; Tennis ball baker's 
dozen

638 Freestanding Pet Gate

Extra tall - Extra wide freestanding gate (41" - 70" 
wide, 28" tall) ($130 value); Basket of seven 
assorted dog toys

639 Rest in the Glow

XL 44"x34" Orthopedic Memory-foam Premium Dog 
Bed ($170 value); Three Kong toys; Glow in the 
Dark large handle ball; Two additional toys; Neon 
green dog size fleece blanket

640 Welcome Dog Lovers

Heavy duty copper/black welcome mat; Wooden 
three hook wall hanger; Stainless steel bowl; 
ceramic mug; Standard size pillowcase; Three 
Nylabones; Kong; Eight soft toys; Grooming mit; 
Leather Collar (Large); Rope ball toy; Hard bone 
shaped toy

641 Savor the Nap

Furhaven Orthopedic Plush Dog Bed, Jumbo ; Large 
ceramic dog bowl; String design dog plaque with 
hooks; Three Kong toys; Four assorted dog toys

642 "K9 Ballistic" Dog Bed

"K9 Ballistic" Rectangle Nesting Dog Bed (Med 27"x 
33") ($109 value); Stainless steel bowl; Four 
assorted toys

643 Time to Eat

Vittles Vault pet food container (50 lbs); Slo Bowl 
Fun Feeder; Dog treats; Kong; Four soft toys; Tug 
toy with ball; Rope toy; Two bones

644 The Dog's Bed

"The Dog's Bed" Premium Orthopedic Waterproof 
Memory Foam Dog Bed (Large 36"x27.5") ($115 
value); 11 Cup stainless steel dog bowl; Four 
assorted dog toys; Fleece throw

645 My Tiny Treasure

$25 Petco gift card; Small treat jar; Travel bowl; 
Silver charm large safety pin; Two Kongs; Nylabone; 
Three tennis balls; Photo key chain; Assorted plush 
toys

646 Port-A-Crate

Indoor/Outdoor Port-A-Crate for pets up to 70 lbs 
(36"L x 25"W x 25"H) ($56 value); Stainless steel 
anti-skid dog bowl; Five assorted dog toys

647 Having A Crate Time

OxGord 36" Dog Crate with divider, double doors, 
heavy duty metal wires, removable plastic floor tray, 
foldable with handle ($45 value); Stainless steel dog 
bowl; Eight assorted toys

648 Fetch & Feast

Raised wooden dog feeder; Ceramic treat jar; Large 
Kong; Four Nylabones; Dog treats; Four soft toys; 
Two rope toys; Collar and leash; Standard size 
pillowcase

649 Dog Days of Summer

Large orange tote bag; Fun Fish Life Jacket (size L, 
55-85 lbs); Nerf toy; Collapsible bowl; Two Tuff 
Bones; Dog treats; Blue collar and leash; Dog brush; 
Flying disc

650 Love My Roomy Crate!

iCrate Folding Double Door Dog Crate including 
divider panel (Large 42"L x 28"W x 30"H); Large 11-
cup stainless steel dog bowl; Seven assorted toys

651 Quiet Time

Quiet Time Pet Bed fits 42" dog crate, machine 
washable; "Love" dog bone photo frame; Dog 
Theme fleece throw; Eight assorted dog toys

652 Doggy Lounger

Furhaven Orthopedic Luxe Lounger Dog Bed 
30"x45"; Eight assorted toys; Dog crate size fleece 
throw

653 Petco Groom Me!

$25 Petco grooming gift certificate; FunFeeder Slo 
Bowl; Seven assorted dog toys; Dog crate size 
fleece throw
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654 Be Cool with Coolaroo Bed

$25 Petco gift card; Coolaroo Bed for Large Dog 
(31.5"x43.3"); 6 ft 2-in-1 dog leash with built-in traffic 
handle; Tuff Lock Dog Collar (Large, 16"-25"); "BIG" 
Nylabone; Ultra Tuff dinosaur toy; Mammoth rope 
toy; Large Chuckit Kick-Fetch ball; Dinosaur hard 
chew toy

655 Eat, Play, and Play

Platinum Pets Raised Bowl Set; Kong Play Pack; 
Nylabone Power Chew Bone set; Hemp dog treats; 
Taco plush toy; Mammoth rope toy; Doggy themed 
pillowcase; Ducky plush toy; Two Kong Squeakair 
Balls; Rope ball

656 Small Dog Thermal Bed

Thermal Pet Mat (14" x 28"); Dog Bakery cookbook; 
Hemp dog treats; Oatmeal shampoo; Leather collar; 
Leash; Hedgehog tow; Pawprint canister with three 
toys inside; Rope toy; "My Dog is My Doorbell" 
wooden plaque

657 Clean and Cool

$25 Petco gift card; Cooling insert for dog bed 
(insert only) (14" x 10.5"; Deluxe Pet Shower 
Sprayer; Pet nail clippers; Eye and Face Care 
Wipes; Towel and two washcloths; My Pet's Friend 
Shampoo; Wooden two-sided brush; Rubber brush; 
Kong Squeeze Ball; Rope toy; Bone plush toy; Tote 
bag

658 Let's Take a Trip!

Two nights of boarding valued at $98–$110 at 
Topanga Pet Resort in Topanga Canyon. Guests 
enjoy plenty of supervised playtime on 6 acres of 
play yards and trails. Accommodations include 
roomy sleeping areas adjoining exercise runs. 
Bedding is provided.
2 Dogs auto shade; Bone shaped license plate 
frame; Dog-E-Glow LED 6ft leash; Large dog collar 
(22" - 28"); 50"x60" travel blanket; Seat belt short 
leash for car travel; Bone shaped keychain (holds 
photo); Treat bag with clip; Foldable cloth travel 
bowl; Tennis ball launcher with extra tennis balls; 
Dog treats; Luggage tag
Terms and Conditions: Dogs will need a free 
"Meet and Greet" session prior to boarding. Must 
bring proof of current vaccines including Rabies 
certificate. Not valid during holiday periods. No 
expiration.

659 Lazy Dog Eat & Play

$25 Lazy Dog gift card; Set of four Kong toys; 
Cesar's Way book; Hemp dog treats; Two 
collapsible bowls; Foam chew bone; Dog house 
themed bird house; Kong bird toy

660 Adjustable Dog Feeder

$25 Petco gift card; Pet Zone adjustable dog feeder 
with three heights 2.75", 8", and 12"; Large Kong 
tennis ball; Four tennis balls; Plastic dog print treat 
jar; Nine assorted dog toys; Dog themed dish towel

661 Bagel Dog Bed

$25 Petsmart gift card; Majestic Pet Bagel Dog Bed 
(Large, 40"); Stainless steel dog bowl; Plastic 
pawprint treat jar; Black lab memo pad; Seven 
assorted dog toys; Dog themed fleece lap throw

662 Cozy Abode

Elite Field Soft Dog Crate with Fleece Bed and 
Carrying Bag (36"L x 24"W x 28"H); Three assorted 
dog toys

663 Paw Pride

Long sleeve XXL shirt; Mug; Training People book; 
Photo frame; Plastic container; Retractable leash 
holder; Fanny pack handmade in Nepal; Kong; 
Lamb Chop toy; Rope toy

664 3 Nights of Resort Living

Three nights of boarding valued at up to $198 at 
Topanga Pet Resort in Topanga Canyon. Guests 
enjoy plenty of supervised playtime on 6 acres of 
play yards and trails. Accommodations include 
roomy sleeping areas adjoining exercise runs. 
Bedding is provided.
Stainless steel non-skid dog bowl; 6' nylon rope 
leash; Kong toy; Five assorted dog toys

665 Barkley Says "Let's Do Coffee"

$10 Starbuck's gift card; Starbuck's Ceramic travel 
cup; Small women's crossbody purse; Pink watch; 
Leather bracelet; Pawprint dog bowl; Dog leash; 
Dog collar (Large 26") Dog squeaky tug toy; 
Crochetted scarf; Oven mitt; Tiny electronic coffee 

667 Whirly Dog

$50 Petco gift card; Original artwork by puppy raiser 
Helen Lau; Black Lab collectors plate by Sally Muir 
for Anthropologie; Black Lab garden spinner; Dog 
crate size fleece blanket

668 Animal Inns of America

Three day stay at Animal Inns of America in Garden 
Grove; Two Kong toys; Rope toy; Large tennis ball; 
Dog crate size fleece throw

669 "Stay"… If Only They Could
Resin dog angel figurine; The Dog Chapel book; I 
Miss My Best Friend book; Black Lab angel with 
golden wings hanging decorative piece; Pawprint 
ornament kit; Black Lab Thank You notes; "In Loving 
Memory" dog ornament; "Dogs Leave Pawprints On 
Your Heart" coaster; Two grey/white leaf patterned 
dish cloths

670 A "Fan" of Dogs

$25 Petsmart gift card; Copper dog fan (electric); 
Inside of a Dog book; "Love" ceramic mug; 
Handmade ceramic dog bowl; Dog brush and 
shampoo; Four cork coasters; Kong; Two 
Nylabones; Three plush toys; Rope toy; Large fleece 
blanket

671 Labbie Lantern

Wrought iron Labbie lantern.
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672 Golden Lantern

Wrought iron Golden lantern.

673 Shepherd Lantern

Wrought iron German Shepherd lantern.

677 German Shepherd Joy

$25 Drs Foster and Smith gift certificate; German 
Shepherd oil painting; German Shepherd ceramic 
planter; GDA stuffed German Shepherd pup with 
bib; German Shepherd etched crystal; German 
Shepherd collectible plate; German Shepherd yard 
stake; Chew rope; German Shepherd keychain

Adventures

702 One Week in Solano Beach

Enjoy 7 days/6 nights of relaxation in a lovely condo 
in Solano Beach, CA. This beautiful home away 
from home has 3 bedrooms (king, queen, two 
twins), 2 1/2 baths, and will accommodate 6 people. 
Plus, a 7th person can be accommodated with 
available pack 'n play or blow up mattress. And, 
enjoy the amenities that SEASCAPE SUR has to 
offer including 2 heated pools, a spa/Jacuzzi, sauna, 
adult lounge and tennis courts. Unfortunately, pets 
are not allowed – including puppies in training.
Terms and Conditions: Stay must be completed by 
June 21, 2020. Dates must be approved by property 
manager. Mid-June through mid-Sept. is generally 
booked, as well as Christmas, New Years, and 
Easter. All tenants must be registered with the 
complex manager. No overnight guests allowed.

704 Week in Big Bear

Spend a week at this lovely cabin in Big Bear. The 
cabin is close to Bear Mountain, Snow Summit, and 
the lake. There are 3 bedrooms (two masters) and 
three baths providing comfortable accomodations 
for 6 people. Plus, there is a lovely deck and fenced 
back yard so GDA dogs (current and prior) are 
always welcome. Just arrange the week and get 
ready to enjoy the mountain air.
Terms and Conditions: Expires 6/22/20. No 
holidays (inquire with owner for special 
arrangement). GDA dogs (current and prior) only.

705 Mammoth Lakes Three Night Stay at 
the Westin Monache Resort

Three night stay in a lovely 7th floor Two-Bedroom 
Suite at the Westin Monache Resort, Mammoth.
This lovely Two-Bedroom Suite has large windows 
and a balcony. The living room includes a cozy gas 
fireplace, 42" high-definition LCD television, and 
plentiful seating - and doubles as an extra bedroom 
thanks to a queen-size sofa bed. There's a dining 
area - and full-size kitchen. There are two private 
bedrooms - one king and one queen - with their own 
TVs. And two sleek, spa-like bathrooms. Plus, the 
resort is pet friendly!
Terms and Conditions: Valid through Oct 15, 
2019. Subject to availability. The resort fee and the 
cleaning fee are included so all of the hotel 
amenities, including the swimming pool, the gym, 
and parking for one car are included. However, daily 
maid service is not included.

706 2 Night Stay in Las Vegas I

You'll enjoy a two night stay in Las Vegas including 
round trip limo transportation to and from McCarren 
International Airport. Take your pick from any of 
Ceasars Entertainment properties in Las Vegas.
Terms and Conditions: Package not available over 
New Year's weekend or Super Bowl weekend. 
Additional blackout dates and restrictions may apply. 
Please be prepared to provide alternate dates. Must 
be used for consecutive nights. Travel must be 
completed by May 31, 2020 and must be booked no 
later than thirty (30) days in advance of scheduled 
arrival. Specific suite type will vary based upon 
availability at the time of booking; not all suite types 
are available as part of this offer. Please allow at 
least 72 hours for confirmation of receipt. This offer 
is exclusive of gratuities and applicable taxes. 
Additional restrictions may apply.

707 2 Night Stay in Las Vegas II

You'll enjoy a two night stay in Las Vegas including 
round trip limo transportation to and from McCarren 
International Airport. Take your pick from any of 
Ceasars Entertainment properties in Las Vegas.
Terms and Conditions: Package not available over 
New Year's weekend or Super Bowl weekend. 
Additional blackout dates and restrictions may apply. 
Please be prepared to provide alternate dates. Must 
be used for consecutive nights. Travel must be 
completed by May 31, 2020 and must be booked no 
later than thirty (30) days in advance of scheduled 
arrival. Specific suite type will vary based upon 
availability at the time of booking; not all suite types 
are available as part of this offer. Please allow at 
least 72 hours for confirmation of receipt. This offer 
is exclusive of gratuities and applicable taxes. 
Additional restrictions may apply.
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708 Mammoth Lakes Four Night Stay for 
up to 8 People

Enjoy four nights in Mammoth for up to 8 people. 
This lovely Snowflower townhouse offers a quiet 
escape with a feeling of total seclusion just steps 
from the free shuttle to Mammoth Ski Area and 
within walking distance of shopping, dining, golf and 
family-friendly entertainment, including a theater and 
bowling alley. Ideal for large groups, this home 
comfortably sleeps 8 guests between two king 
bedrooms and a spacious loft with a queen and full 
bed. A full sleeper sofa in the living room 
accommodates two additional guests. The 
bedrooms, located on the lower and main floors 
have flat-screen TVs and en-suite baths. The loft 
features mountain decor.
Terms and Conditions: Expires December 15, 
2019. No pets allowed. Not available for July 4th or 
Labor Day. If there is damage or additional cleaning 
beyond the normal housekeeping, you must agree to 
be responsible.

709 Two Night Stay at The Franciscan Inn 
in Santa Barbara

Enjoy a two night stay in a Franciscan Suite at The 
Franciscan Inn in beautiful Santa Barbara.
The Franciscan Inn began as a Spanish-style house 
on a beachside ranch in the 1920s. Today's 
gracious 53-room Franciscan Inn boasts all the 
comforts and up-to-date amenities of contemporary 
life, while retaining the old-world charm of its roots. 
The Inn has become an ideal refuge for the modern 
traveler - whether you're visiting for business, 
vacation or an extended stay, you'll enjoy warm 
hospitality along with Santa Barbara's world-
renowned attractions and legendary climate.
Terms and Conditions: Not valid in July, August, or 
on National Holidays. Expires June 22, 2020.

710 Two nights at Treasure Island in Las 
Vegas Plus Cirque du Soleil

Looking for a fun getaway? Well, how about heading 
to Treasure Island in Las Vegas! This package 
includes a two night stay in a Deluxe room at 
Treasure Island. Plus, you'll receive tickets for two to 
see Mystere by Cirque du Soleil. And, there is so 
much to do while you are there -- pools, golfing, 
shopping, and of course gambling. So, pack your 
bags and enjoy some fun in the Las Vegas sun.
Terms and Conditions: When making your travel 
plans, please note the certificate is valid until June 
22, 2020. Reservations must be made in advance. 
When making reservations, it would be helpful to 
submit several dates as your stay is subject to 
availability.

711 2 Nights at The Linq in Las Vegas and 
Dinner for Two at Guy Fieri's Vegas 

Kitchen & Bar

You'll enjoy a three day/two night stay in a standard 
room at The Linq (Sunday through Thursday) 
located on the world famous Las Vegas Strip. In 
addition, you'll enjoy dinner for two at Guy Fieri's 
Vegas Kitchen & Bar (valued at up to $100 in food 
and beverages - does not include gratuity). The 
Vegas Kitchen & Bar offers Fieri's signature cuisine 
as well as an extensive drink menu featuring 16 craft 
beers and a wine selection from Sonoma County. 
So, pack your bags and get ready to enjoy all that 
Vegas has to offer.
Terms and Conditions: Reservations based on 
availability and are not available during certain 
special events or holiday periods. Amenities are not 
included. Expires June 22, 2020 and no extensions 
will be granted.

712 Fly Alaska

Two round trip coach tickets on Alaska Airlines. The 
tickets are valid for flights served by Alaska Airlines 
flights numbered 1-2999, SkyWest Airlines flights 
3300-3499, and PenAir flights 3124-3299.
So, plan your vacation, family gathering, or college 
visit with the help of these two tickets from Alaska 
Airlines.
Terms and Conditions: Expires June 22, 2020. Not 
valid for flights on codeshare partners. Mileage Plan 
Miles cannot be earned or credited. First Class paid 
upgrades or mileage plan upgrades are allowed. 
Standard baggage fees apply; see checked 
baggage policy and flight schedules at 
www.alaskaair.com for more details. Individual travel 
taxes may apply. Once ticketed, no changes to 
passenger name, origin city or destination city 
allowed. If lost, certificate may not be reissued.

713 2 Night Stay at Riverside Resort Hotel 
and Casino in Laughlin

You'll enjoy a three day/two night stay at Don 
Laughlin's Riverside Resort Hotel & Casino in 
Laughlin, NV. The resort was founded and 
established in 1966 as Laughlin's first hotel and 
casino. The Riverside Resort is located on the 
banks of the beautiful Colorado River. Owned and 
operated by Don Laughlin and his family, guests will 
find a number of fun activities while staying at 
Laughlin's family-friendly resort. Enjoy Nevada-style 
gaming action and entertainment 24 hours a day in a 
relaxed small-town atmosphere.
Terms and Conditions: Redemption of this award 
is subject to availability of rooms and advanced 
reservation is required. Certificate is for a standard 
room from Sunday - Thursday and is not valid during 
weekends, special events or holidays. Certificate is 
non-transferable and not valid with any other 
promotion. Expires Nov 30, 2019.
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Entertainment

800 4 Terrace Box Hollywood Bowl seats 
for Tuesday, August 6 at 8pm

Enjoy an evening of classical music for four at the 
Hollywood Bowl on Tuesday, August 6 at 8pm. 
Immerse yourself in the concert from Terrace Box 
1353 with director type seats and tables (can 
accommodate four people or three people and a 
Guide Dog). You can bring your own dinner and 
drinks (wine, cocktails etc.) or order it thru the Bowl. 
(If you elect to have dinner in the box catered by the 
Hollywood Bowl, you'll want to arrive well before the 
concert starts. The box will be available as early as 
6:00 p.m. for your picnic dinner.)
Two beloved masterworks by Mozart make up this 
progra – Symphony No. 41, "Jupiter" and Requiem. 
The pieces will be presented by the Budapest 
Festival Orchestra with Ivan Fischer conducting.
So, place your bid and get ready for a spectacular 
evening at the Bowl!

801 Pink Martini and the LA Phil for 4 at 
the Hollywood Bowl in Terrace Box 

Seats

Enjoy a night at the Bowl on August 25, 2019 at 
7:30pm. Entertain friends and enjoy the concert from 
your own private Terrace Box in one of the best 
locations at the Hollywood Bowl. You'll receive 4 
tickets for Box 1337 which can accommodate four 
people or three people and a Guide Dog.
The eclectic "little orchestra" from Portland sashays 
their way through the swinging sounds of the 20th 
century, from the colorful sambas of Brazil, to the 
rhythms of mid-century Havana, to the chansons of 
Pacafes, all united with a romantic swirl of classic 
Hollywood and backed by the Hollywood Bowl 
Orchestra, making for an enchanted evening. Iconic 
organist Booker T. Jones kicks off the evening 
commemorating the extraordinarily influential 
catalog of the Memphis Stax label, including songs 
from soul icons Sam & Dave, and Otis Redding.

802 Sea World San Diego for 4

Enjoy a family day for four at Sea World, San Diego. 
You'll see dolphins, sea lions, sharks, and so much 
more! What a terrific way to spend a day... sunshine, 
San Diego, and the sea!
Terms and Conditions: Tickets expire June 1, 
2020. Not valid on these dates: 7/4/19, 7/6/19, 
7/13/19, 7/20/19, 7/27/19, 8/3/19, 9/1/19, and 
12/26/19 through 12/31/19.

817 Hollywood Bowl

Pair of Reserved Bench Seats for Tuesday or 
Thursday night concerts; J. Lohr Cabernet 
Sauvignon; 28" precious stone necklace; Two red 
wine crysal goblets; Two handmade napkins; 
Decorative ceramic serving plate
Terms and Conditions: Only valid for events 
presented by the LA Phil. Excludes July 2 and 4 
concerts. Exclusion dates may be added at any time 
at the discretion of the box office.

818 Cheesecake Factory

$50 Cheesecake factory gift card; Bottle of Dubost 
Cabernet Sauvignon 2011; Two wrought iron and 
glass candle sticks; Trader Joe's Bruschetta; 
Cooking Light Annual Recipes 1998

819 Magic Castle

Guest passes for four to Magic Castle; Bottle of 
Traditional Arack specialty liqueur; Two cut glass 
goblets; Notepads
Terms and Conditions: Certificate expires once it 
is redeemed and cannot be reused for any purpose. 
The official VIP pass will expire on December 31, 
2019. Those redeeming after October 1st of each 
year will receive a pass that expires at the end of the 
following year. The VIP pass cannot be replaced or 
extended if unused and expired. Dining is required 
with a one entrée minimum per person and a 
reservation must be set prior to visiting.

820 Island Adventure

Day trip to Anacapa or Santa Cruz islands with 
Island Packers (Expires February 9, 2020); $25 
Exxon/Mobil gift card; Decorative serving tray; Two 
labbie dish towels; Handmade trinket dish

821 Pasadena Date Night

Two tickets to any performance at A Noise Within 
theatre (expires June 2020); $25 P.F. Changs gift 
card; Menage a Trois Cabernet Sauvignon; 19 
Crimes Cabernet; Precious stone 24" necklace and 
bracelet; Cut crystal candie dish

822 Magical Night

Amazing Package including admission for four to the 
Magic Castle plus $250 Magic Castle gift card.
Trio of Battery Powered candlestick holders (remote 
control charges colors of the light)
Terms and Conditions: Certificate expires once it 
is redeemed and cannot be reused for any purpose. 
The official VIP pass will expire on December 31, 
2019. Those redeeming after October 1st of each 
year will receive a pass that expires at the end of the 
following year. The VIP pass cannot be replaced or 
extended if unused and expired. Dining is required 
with a one entrée minimum per person and a 
reservation must be set prior to visiting.
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823 Vino

Dubost Cabernet 2011 ($40 value); The Weekender 
Meritage 2011 ($50 value); Temerity Pinot Noir 2014 
($35 value); $50 Cheesecake Factory gift card; Two 
crystal red wine goblets 

824 San Diego Adventure

Four passes to the Midway Museum; Four passes to 
the Maritime Museum; Large canvas tote bag; Two 
Flip Flop candle holders

825 Dr Phil's BBQ

$50 Lucille's Smokehouse Bar-B-Que gift card; VIP 
Passes for four to the Dr Phil Show; Ceramic 
serving bowl; Two decorative towels; Dr Phil coffee 
mug; Love Smart and What's Age Got To Do With It
books

826 Medieval Times

Two general admission tickets to enjoy dinner and 
show at Medieval Times in Buena Park; Two bottles 
of Tawny Port; Two wine glasses
Terms and Conditions: Expire December 30, 
2020. Tickets are only valid at Buena Park, CA 
location. Tickets are not valid for New Years Eve or 
Holiday shows. Not valid for special engagements. 
Restaurant seating is subject to availability.

827 Golf for Four

Enjoy a foursome of golf including golf carts at the 
Valencia Country Club in Valencia ($500 value); Two 
Polo shirts (Men's Lrg and Women's Med); Two golf 
towels; Assorted tees and markers
Terms and Conditions: Expires December 22, 
2019. Must call for reservations. Valid for play 
Tuesday, Wednesday or Thursday after 11am. 
Dress code strictly enforced.

828 Bowl for Two

Pair of Reserved Bench Seats for Tuesday or 
Thursday night concerts; Nectar of the Dogs White 
Blend; Hand crafted ceramic bowl
Terms and Conditions: Only valid for events 
presented by the LA Phil. Excludes July 2 and 4 
concerts. Exclusion dates may be added at any time 
at the discretion of the box office.

829 Happy Anniversary Honey

Enjoy a two night stay at the Crowne Plaza Hotel 
Ventura Beach in an Ocean View King room; 20" 
blue necklace; Bottle of Maui Blanc wine; The Santa 
Clara Valley of Ventura County book
Terms and Conditions: Expires April 2020. 
Advance reservations required. Blackout dates may 
apply. Not valid during July, August, Holidays, and 
blackout periods. Ocean View room is based on 
availability.

830 Marmalade

$50 Marmalade gift card; Decorative wall hanging; 
Bottle of J. Lohr Pinot Noir 2017

838 Race to the Grill

$25 Red's BBQ gift certificate; $10 El Pollo Loco gift 
card; Two passes for Kart Racing at K1 Speed 
locations; Grillinopoly game

839 Brunch & A Movie

Sunday brunch for four at The SmokeHouse in 
Burbank (expires December 22, 2019); Four passes 
to Laemmle Theatres (not valid for special 
engagements); Martha Stewart oblong 102"x60" 
tablecloth; Decorative plate; Bottle of Cass 2014 
Roussanne White; Two GDA wine glasses

840 Italian Fest

$100 Olive Garden gift card; Italian ceramic serving 
dish; Trader Joe's Marinara Sauce, artisan pasta, 
pesto, sundried tomatoes; Tuscan Bruschetta

841 Golf in La Canada

Enjoy a foursome of golf at the La Canada Flintridge 
Country Club (does not include golf carts); GDA cap; 
GDA Polo shirt (size Sm); Two golf towels
Terms and Conditions: Expires June 30, 2020. 
Proper golf attire is required. Tee times available 
Tues after 12pm or Wed/Thurs/Fri between 7-9am 
or after 12pm. Certificate may not be redeemed for 
cash.

842 California Dreamin'

$50 California Pizza Kitchen gift card; Floral serving 
tray; Cheese knives and cutting board; Bottle of 
Nectar of the Dogs Rose; Wine opener; California 
Then and Now; Picnic blanket; Two cloth napkins; 
Two plastic drinking cups

843 Think Snow!

2 All Day Lift Tickets for any day during the 
2018-2019 season at Snow Valley Mountain Resort 
in Running Springs, CA; XL Lands End Fleece 
Jacket; Puzzle; Magic 8 Ball
Terms and Conditions: Lift tickets expire at the 
end of the 2019-2020 season or March 31, 2020 
(whichever comes first). Valid any day including 
holidays

844 More Magic!

Admission for four to the Magic Castle ($140 value); 
Ceramic lazy susan
Terms and Conditions: Certificate expires once it 
is redeemed and cannot be reused for any purpose. 
The official VIP pass will expire on December 31, 
2019. Those redeeming after October 1st of each 
year will receive a pass that expires at the end of the 
following year. The VIP pass cannot be replaced or 
extended if unused and expired. Dining is required 
with a one entrée minimum per person and a 
reservation must be set prior to visiting.

845 Dinner & A Play

$50 Black Angus gift card; Two tickets for regular 
seating at the Canyon Theatre Guild in Newhall 
(expire June 22, 2020); Soapstone cheese platter; 
Two cheese servers
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846 Night Out

$50 Brent's Deli gift card; Two Regal Cinema 
passes; Ceramic cheese plate; Ceramic cheese 
spreader set; Bottle of Saddlerock Tawny Port

847 Where's the Beef?

$50 Fleming's Steakhouse gift card; Yoshi Blade 
Ceramic Knife and Kitchen set; Eight steak knives; 
Labbie dish towel

848 Good Stuff

$25 Art's Deli gift card; $25 Regal Theaters gift card; 
Gift certificate for We Olive in Ventura good for one 
olive oil/vinegar tasting plus 8.5 oz bottle of olive oil; 
Bottle of Justin 2010 Merlot; Two wine goblets; Wine 
stopper; Wine markers; Decorative serving plate

849 High Flying Dogs

Four passes for Planes of Fame air museum; Dog 
Heroes; Stuffed toy (not for dogs); Stainless steel 
bowl; Kong; Two Nylabones; 4"x6" photo frame; 
Flag dog tag; Three flag theme napkins; Plush toy

851 More Golf

18 hole golf foursome at Knollwood Country Club in 
Granada Hills including cart; Four Titleist golf balls; 
Large Men's GDA poloshirt; Small Women's GDA 
Poloshirt; Two insulated mugs; Diamana Ladies 
Driver
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